

# RIVERHEAD CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

700 Osborn Avenue  
Riverhead, NY 11901-2996  
FAX (631) 369-0188 [www.riverhead.net](http://www.riverhead.net)

Dr. Aurelia L. Henriquez  
Superintendent of Schools  
(631) 369-6717



Sam M. Schneider  
Deputy Superintendent  
(631) 369-6708

Janette Velardi, C.P.M.  
Purchasing Agent  
(631) 369-8565  
[janette.velardi@riverhead.net](mailto:janette.velardi@riverhead.net)

## ADDENDUM 1

### **Bid: RH21-009 Printing Services for School District**

---

To All Bidders:

Additional information is being provided in order to assist you in preparing a response for the above referenced bid as follows:

A prospective bidder has asked?

I would like to request a FOIL please. Last bid with who won and for how much.

Response:

Please see the attached document.

<b>Newspapers</b>						
<b><u>1A-Newsletter</u></b>	Quantity	Printing cost	Cost for Additional 100 Pieces	Cost of a Proof	Fulfillment cost	Total cost
Courier Printing	22,000	\$ 2,039.00	\$ 7.00	Inc.	inc.	\$ 2,046.00
Graphic Image	22,000	\$ 1,985.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 2,431.00
Ocean Printing	22,000	\$ 1,865.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 330.00	\$ 2,250.00
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$ 2,785.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	inc.	\$ 2,805.00
Printcorp.	22,000	\$ 1,990.00	\$ 9.00	no charge	\$ 340.00	\$ 2,339.00

<b><u>1B-District Newspaper</u></b>	Quantity	Printing cost	Cost for Additional 100 Pieces	Cost of a Proof	Fulfillment cost	Total cost
Courier Printing	22,000	\$ 3,520.00	\$ 13.00	inc	inc	\$ 3,533.00
Minute Man Press	22,000	\$ 9,915.63	\$ 149.88	\$10 after 3	no bid	\$ 10,075.51
Ocean Printing	22,000	\$ 5,575.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 330.00	\$ 6,045.00
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$ 4,790.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 75.00	inc.	\$ 8,470.00
Printcorp	22,000	\$ 3,680.00	\$ 16.70	no charge	\$ 340.00	\$ 4,036.70

<b><u>1C-6 Day Notice Budget Flyer</u></b>	Quantity	Printing cost	Cost for Additional 100 Pieces	Cost of a Proof	Fulfillment cost	Total cost
Courier Printing	22,000	\$ 1,154.000	\$ 3.000	inc.	inc.	\$ 1,157.00
Graphic Image	22,000	\$ 1,195.000	\$ 7.400	\$ 60.000	\$ 375.000	\$ 1,637.40
Minute Man Press	22,000	\$ 1,638.480	\$ 10.000	\$10 after 3	no bid	\$ 1,658.48
Ocean Printing	22,000	\$ 545.000	\$ 5.000	\$ 10.000	\$ 330.000	\$ 890.00
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$ 1,197.000	\$ 4.000	\$ 10.000	inc.	\$ 1,211.00
Printcorp	22,000	\$ 890.00	\$ 4.04	no charge	\$ 340.00	\$ 1,234.04

**SCHOOL CALENDAR**

<u>2A-FULL COLOR CALENDAR</u>	Quantity	Printing cost	Cost for Additional 100 Pieces	Cost of a Proof	Fulfillment cost	Total cost
Courier Printing	22,000	\$9,467.00	\$36.00 inc		inc.	\$9,503.00
Graphic Image	22,000	\$9,460.00	\$46.50	\$210.00	\$560.00	\$10,276.50
Ocean Printing	22,000	\$12,690.00	\$25.00	\$120.00	\$665.00	\$10,270.00
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$14,611.00	\$50.00	\$200.00 inc.		\$14,861.00
Printcorp	22,000	\$12,540.00	\$57.00	no charge	\$860.00	\$13,457.00

<u>2B-2 Color Calendar</u>	Quantity	Printing cost	Cost for Additional 100 Pieces	Cost of a Proof	Fulfillment cost	Total cost
Courier Printing	22,000	\$6,367.00	\$25.00 inc.		inc.	\$6,392.00
Graphic Image	22,000	\$8,110.00	\$40.00	\$200.00	\$560.00	\$8,910.00
Ocean Printing	22,000	\$9,975.00	\$25.00	\$120.00	\$665.00	\$10,785.00
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$13,432.00	\$40.00	\$100.00 inc.		\$13,572.00
Printcorp	22,000	\$12,190.00	\$55.00 no charge		\$860.00	\$13,105.00

<u>2C - 1 Color Calendar</u>	Quantity	Printing cost	Cost for Additional 100 Pieces	Cost of a Proof	Fulfillment cost	Total cost
Courier Printing	22,000	\$6,203.00	\$25.00 inc.		inc.	\$6,228.00
Graphic Image	22,000	\$7,530.00	\$37.50	\$190.00	\$560.00	\$8,317.50
Ocean Printing	22,000	\$8,475.00	\$20.00	\$120.00	\$665.00	\$9,280.00
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$13,237.00	\$30.00	\$75.00 inc.		\$13,342.00
Printcorp	22,000	\$11,455.00	\$52.00 no charge		\$860.00	\$12,367.00

**3**

**BOOKS, BOOKLETS, HANDBOOKS**

<b>3-A Kindergarten Parent Information Guide</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Minute Man Press	250 @ \$327.95	500 @ \$588.89	750 @ \$465.00	\$10 after 3
Ocean Printing	250 @395.00	500 @430.00	750 @ \$811.52	\$25.00
Printcorp	250 @ \$117.00	500 @ \$185.00	750 @ \$235.00	
Savon Printing	250 @ \$168.00	500 @ \$219.00	750 @ \$270.00	\$25.00
<b>Thomas Graphics</b>	<b>250 @ \$90.00</b>	<b>500 @ \$135.00</b>	<b>750 @ \$180.00</b>	no charge

<b>3B-Riverhead Kindergarten</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Courier Printing Corp	250 @ \$398.00	500 @ \$523.00	inc.
Minute Man Press	250 @ \$740.89	500 @ \$1299.82	\$10 after 3
Ocean Printing	250 @ \$650.00	500 @ \$715.00	\$ 85.00
<b>Printcorp</b>	<b>250 @ \$155.00</b>	<b>500 @ \$279.00</b>	no charge
Savon Printing	250 @ \$408.00	500 @ \$523.00	\$ 25.00
Thomas Graphics	250 @ \$210.00	500 @ \$390.00	no charge

<b>3C-FAMILY HANDBOOK</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Courier Printing Corp.	550 @ \$610.00	Cost for add'l 100 copiers \$56.00		inc.
Minute Man Press	550 @ \$771.04	Cost for add'l 100 copiers \$120.08		
Ocean Printing	550 @ \$1195.00	Cost for add'l 100 copiers \$40.00		\$135.00
Printcorp.	550 @ \$490.00	Cost for add'l 100 copiers \$89.00		no charge
Savon Printing	550 @ \$482.00	Cost for add'l 100 copiers \$75.00		\$25.00
<b>Thomas Graphics</b>	<b>550 @ \$429.00</b>	<b>Cost for add'l 100 copiers \$75.00</b>		no charge

<b>3D-COURSE OFFERING BOOKLET</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Proof</b>
Courier Printing Corp	100 @ \$946.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.21	200 @ \$1167.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.21	Included \$10 after 3 proofs
Minute Man Press	100 @ \$351.60	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.52	200 @ \$639.54	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.52	
Printcorp.	100 @ \$220.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.20	200 @ \$390.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.95	No Charge
Savon Printing	100 @ \$385.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.63	200 @ \$707.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.42	
Thomas Graphics	100 @ \$190.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.90	200 @ \$340.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.70	No Charge

<b>3E-COLLEGE ADMISSIONS GUIDE</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Proof</b>
Courier Printing Corp.	250 @ \$11025.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$12.20	500 @ \$1410.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$12.20	included \$10 after 3
Minute Man Press	250 @ \$832.74	Cost per add'l. copy \$no bid	500 @ \$1562.73	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.50	
Ocean Printing	250 @ \$2555.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$5.00	500 @ \$2745.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$5.00	\$265.00
Printcorp.	250 @ \$490.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.95	500 @ \$930.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.86	no charge
Savon Printing	250 @ \$892.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.47	500 @ \$1587.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$3.13	\$25.00
Thomas Graphics	250 @ \$540.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.10	500 @ \$925.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.80	

<b>3F-Labrynth</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Printcorp	250 @ \$1198.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$4.79					No Charge
Thomas Graphics	56 pg/250 @ \$375.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$1.50					No Charge
Courier Printing	56 pgs/250 @ \$1248.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$	60 pgs/250 @ \$1475.00	64 pgs./250 @ \$1292.00	68 pgs./250 @ \$1523.00	72 pgs/250 @ \$1540.00	
Minuteman Press	56 pgs/250 @ \$1740.58	Cost per add'l. copy \$6.97	60 pgs/250 @ \$1846.63	64 pgs./250 @ \$1948.67	68 pgs./250 @ \$2049.91	72 pgs/250 @ \$2145.54	
Savon Printing	56 pgs/250 @ \$1465.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$	60 pgs/250 @ \$1563.00	64 pgs./250 @ \$1660.00	68 pgs./250 @ \$1758.00	72 pgs/250 @ \$1855.00	

<b>3G-LATIN TEXT BOOK</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Printcorp.	50 @ \$1120.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$10.40	75 @ \$1600.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$10.06	no charge
Thomas Graphics	50 @ \$375.00	Cost per add'l. copy 7.50	75 @ \$560.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$7.50	no charge
Savon Printing	50 @ \$900.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$17.50	75 @ \$1275.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$16.50	\$25.00

<b>3H-VEHICLE INSPECTION REPORT BOOK</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Printcorp	300 books @\$755.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.51	600 books @ \$1470.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.45	no charge
Thomas Graphics	300 books @\$740.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.30	600 books @ \$1330.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.20	no charge

<b>3I-School Profile Booklet</b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Proof</u></b>
Printcorp	250 @ \$128.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$.51	500 @ \$210.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$.42	no charge
Thomas Graphics	250 @ \$85.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$.30	500 @ \$140.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$.25	no charge
Courier Printing Corp	250 @ \$175.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.00	500 @ \$225.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$2.00	included
Minuteman Press	250 @ \$149.73	Cost per add'l. copy \$.60	500 @ \$249.46	Cost per add'l. copy \$.60	\$10 after 3
Savon Printing	250 @ \$165.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$.60	500 @ \$319.00	Cost per add'l. copy \$.60	no bid

**4**

**ENVELOPES**

<b>#10 White Wove Envelopes-Standard</b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Proof</u></b>
Printcorp	2500 @ \$114.00	5000 @ \$116.00	10,000 @ 280.00	20,000 @ \$495.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	2500 @ \$192.50	5000 @ \$315.00	10,000 @ \$500.00	20,000 @ \$960.00	\$10 after 3
Ocean Printing	2500 @ \$145.00	5000 @ \$220.00	10,000 @ \$355.00	20,000 @ \$625.00	\$10.00
Pine Barrens Printing	2500 @ \$165.00	5000 @ \$265.00	10,000 @ \$475.00	20,000 @ \$no bid	\$10.00
Savon Printing	2500 @ \$140.25	5000 @ \$254.25	10,000 @ \$449.00	20,000 @ \$871.00	no bid

<b>#10 White Wove Window Envelopes</b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Quantity/Cost</u></b>	<b><u>Proof</u></b>
Printcorp	2500 @ \$124.00	5000 @ \$185.00	10,000 @ \$310.00	20,000 @ \$580.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	2500 @ \$207.50	5000 @ \$345.00	10,000 @ \$555.00	20,000 @ \$1070.00	\$10 after 3
Ocean Printing	2500 @ \$145.00	5000 @ \$ 220.00	10,000 @ \$355.00	20,000 @ \$625.00	\$10.00
Pine Barrens Printin	2500 @ \$165.00	5000 @ \$265.00	10,000 @ \$475.00	20,000 @ \$no bid	
Savon Printing	2500 @ \$147.75	5000 @ \$269.25	10,000 @ \$477.00	20,000 @ \$927.00	no bid

<b>4C- Report Card/Progress Report Envelope-Customized</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Proof</u>
Printcorp	500 @ \$110.00	1000 @ \$124.00	2500 @\$245.00	5000 @ \$425.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	500 @ \$114.33	1000 @ \$206.79	2500 @ \$486.88	5000 @ \$732.50	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens	500 @ NO BID	1000 @ \$127.00	2500 @ \$269.00	5000 @ \$506.00	\$10.00
Savon Printing	500 @ \$137.00	1000 @ \$162.00	2500 @ \$353.00	5000 @ \$635.25	

5

FORMS

<b>5A.1 - 5.5" x 8.5", 2 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$86.00	2500 @ \$141.00	5000 @ \$262.00	10,000 @ \$504.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$61.00	2500 @ \$145.00	5000 @ \$185.00	10,000 @ \$270.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$97.85	2500 @ \$210.87	5000 @ \$394.24	10,000 @ \$761.19	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$115.00	2500 @ \$231.00	5000 @ \$422.00	10,000 @ \$806.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$134.00	2500 @ \$175.00	5000 @ \$235.00	10,000 @ \$437.00	no bid

<b>5A.2 - 5.5" x 8.5", 3 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$119.00	2500 @ \$196.00	5000 @ \$349.00	10,000 @ \$679.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$63.00	2500 @ \$155.00	5000 @ \$270.00	10,000 @ \$440.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$143.38	2500 @ \$318.34	5000 @ \$613.65	10,000 @ \$1165.24	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$157.00	2500 @ \$334.00	5000 @ \$630.00	10,000 @ \$1231.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$193.00	2500 @ \$218.00	5000 @ \$341.00	10,000 @ \$641.00	no bid

<b>5A.3 - 5.5" x 8.5", 4 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$142.00	2500 @ \$284.00	5000 @ \$471.00	10,000 @ \$923.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$115.00	2500 @ \$175.00	5000 @ \$330.00	10,000 @ \$560.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$185.90	2500 @ \$424.76	5000 @ \$822.23	10,000 @ \$1534.18	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$210.00	2500 @ \$465.00	5000 @ \$893.00	10,000 @ \$1588.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$213.00	2500 @ \$258.00	5000 @ \$411.00	10,000 @ \$711.00	no bid



Bid Opening Date: May 17,2017 @ 11:00 AM

<b>5A.4 8.5" x 11", 2 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$108.00	2500 @ \$218.00	5000 @ \$427.00	10,000 @ \$768.00	no charge
<b>Thomas Graphics</b>	<b>1000 @ \$105.00</b>	<b>2500 @ \$180.00</b>	<b>5000 @ \$270.00</b>	<b>10,000 @ \$410.00</b>	<b>no charge</b>
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$183.55	2500 @ \$425.14	5000 @ \$819.62	10,000 @ \$1516.63	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$192.00	2500 @ \$422.00	5000 @ \$806.00	10,000 @ \$1574.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$165.00	2500 @ \$243.00	5000 @ \$371.00	10,000 @ \$696.00	no bid

<b>5A.5 8.5" x 11", 3 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$163.00	2500 @ \$328.00	5000 @ \$624.00	10,000 @ \$1130.00	no charge
<b>Thomas Graphics</b>	<b>1000 @ \$175.00</b>	<b>2500 @ \$224.00</b>	<b>5000 @ \$345.00</b>	<b>10,000 @ \$589.00</b>	<b>no charge</b>
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$292.84	2500 @ \$689.26	5000 @ \$1310.86	10,000 @ \$2441.34	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$277.00	2500 @ \$635.00	5000 @ \$1231.00	10,000 @ \$2401.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$226.00	2500 @ \$289.00	5000 @ \$455.00	10,000 @ \$856.00	no bid

<b>5A.6 8.5" x 11", 4 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$240.00	2500 @ \$515.00	5000 @ \$812.00	10,000 @ \$1494.00	no charge
<b>Thomas Graphics</b>	<b>1000 @ \$213.00</b>	<b>2500 @ \$255.00</b>	<b>5000 @ \$420.00</b>	<b>10,000 @ \$759.00</b>	<b>no charge</b>
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$387.96	2500 @ \$925.42	5000 @ \$1730.57	10,000 @ \$3340.90	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$380.00	2500 @ \$893.00	5000 @ \$1588.00	10,000 @ \$3137.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$313.00	2500 @ \$344.00	5000 @ \$579.300	10,000 @ \$1008.00	no bid

<b>5A.7 8.5" x 14", 2 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$163.00	2500 @ \$328.00	5000 @ \$592.00	10,000 @ \$955.00	no charge
<b>Thomas Graphics</b>	<b>1000 @ \$190.00</b>	<b>2500 @ \$215.00</b>	<b>5000 @ \$312.00</b>	<b>10,000 @ \$522.00</b>	<b>no charge</b>
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$224.28	2500 @ \$527.00	5000 @ \$1023.35	10,000 @ \$1924.08	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$217.00	2500 @ \$483.00	5000 @ \$927.00	10,000 @ \$1814.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$198.00	2500 @ \$282.00	5000 @ \$444.00	10,000 @ \$838.00	no bid

Bid Opening Date: May 17,2017 @ 11:00 AM

<b>5A.8 8.5" x 14", 3 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$218.00	2500 @ \$438.00	5000 @ \$768.00	10,000 @ \$1373.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$219.00	2500 @ \$280.00	5000 @ \$463.00	10,000 @ \$780.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$320.20	2500 @ \$757.65	5000 @ \$1447.65	10,000 @ \$2714.90	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$326.00	2500 @ \$756.00	5000 @ \$1472.00	10,000 @ \$2904.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$207.00	2500 @ \$340.00	5000 @ \$487.00	10,000 @ \$919.00	no bid

<b>5A.9 8.5" x 14", 4 part carbonless, 1c/1s</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$284.00	2500 @ \$647.00	5000 @ \$906.00	10,000 @ \$1835.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$250.00	2500 @ \$328.00	5000 @ \$540.00	10,000 @ \$980.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$446.48	2500 @ \$1071.71	5000 @ \$2023.16	10,000 @ \$3926.07	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$439.00	2500 @ \$1039.00	5000 @ \$2039.00	10,000 @ \$4039.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$240.00	2500 @ \$406.00	5000 @ \$680.00	10,000 @ \$1185.00	no bid

<b>5B CUMULATIVE HEALTH RECORD FOLDER</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$320.00	2500 @ \$530.00	5000 @ \$899.00	10,000 @ \$1580.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$350.00	2500 @ \$845.00	5000 @ \$1450.00	10,000 @ \$2400.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$500.74	2500 @ \$1081.23	5000 @ \$1918.71	10,000 @ \$3629.92	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$342.00	2500 @ \$624.00	5000 @ \$1103.00	10,000 @ \$2041.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$340.00	2500 @ \$669.00	5000 @ \$1232.00	10,000 @ \$2184.00	no bid

<b>5C PERMANENT RECORD/PERSONAL DATA</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
Printcorp	1000 @ \$175.00	2500 @ \$277.00	5000 @ \$407.00	10,000 @ \$730.00	no charge
Thomas Graphics	1000 @ \$130.00	2500 @ \$280.00	5000 @ \$525.00	10,000 @ \$970.00	no charge
Minuteman Press	1000 @ \$158.88	2500 @ \$362.84	5000 @ \$669.41	10,000 @ \$1276.32	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1000 @ \$221.00	2500 @ \$517.00	5000 @ \$709.00	10,000 @ \$1015.00	\$10
Savon Printing	1000 @ \$123.00	2500 @ \$266.00	5000 @ \$393.00	10,000 @ \$695.00	no bid

**6**

**POSTCARD**

<b>A- Budget Notice Postcard</b>	<b>Quantity/Cost</b>	<b>Printing Cost</b>	<b>Cost for additional 100 pieces</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>	<b>Fulfillment Cost</b>		
Graphic Image	22,000	\$ 1,560.00	\$ 9.45	\$ 40.00	\$ 480.00	\$	2,089.45
Courier Printing Copr	22,000	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 3.00	inc.	inc.	\$	1,053.00
<b>Ocean Printing</b>	<b>22,000</b>	<b>\$ 695.00</b>	<b>\$ 1.00</b>	<b>\$ 15.00</b>	<b>\$ 330.00</b>	<b>\$</b>	<b>1,041.00</b>
Print Corp.	22,000	\$ 748.00	\$ 3.40	no charge	\$ 340.00	\$	1,091.40
Minuteman Press	<b>21,000</b>	\$ 1,135.97	\$ 5.16	\$10 after 3	\$ 150.00	\$	1,291.13
Pine Barrens Printing	22,000	\$ 1,263.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 286.00	\$	1,565.00

**7**

**COMMENCEMENT**

<b>7A - Commencement Program- High School</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Printing Cost</b>	<b>Cost for additional 100 pieces</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
<b>Printcorp</b>	<b>1500</b>	<b>\$ 510.00</b>	<b>\$ 34.00</b>	<b>no charge</b>
Minuteman Press	1500	\$ 1,964.78	\$ 1,012.51	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1500	\$ 985.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 25.00
Savon Printing	1500	\$ 1,174.00	\$ 50.00	no bid

<b>7B - Commencement Tickets</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Printing Cost</b>	<b>Cost for additional 100 pieces</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
Ocean Printing	1500	\$ 175.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00
<b>Printcorp</b>	<b>1500</b>	<b>\$ 55.00</b>	<b>\$ 3.66</b>	<b>no charge</b>
Minuteman Press	1500	\$ 65.29	\$ 2.68	\$10 after 3
Pine Barrens Printing	1500	\$ 99.00	\$ 5.00	\$10.00
Savon Printing	1500	\$ 100.00	\$ 5.00	no biod

<b>7C- Graduation Booklet- Elementary School</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Printing Cost</b>	<b>Cost for additional 100 pieces</b>	<b>Cost of a Proof</b>
<b>NO BIDS</b>	350	\$	Cost per each add'l. copy \$	\$

<b>8 Book Identification Label</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Print Corp	5000 @ \$290.00	10,000 @ \$369.	15,000 @ \$568.	20,000 @ \$680.	no charge
Pine Barrens Printing	5000 @ \$931.00	10,000 @ \$1036.	15,000 @ \$1129.	20,000 @ \$1235.	no charge

<b>9A Letterhead</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Minuteman Press	1,000 @ \$313.35	2,500 @ \$650.72	5,000 @ \$1225.64	10,000 @ \$2375.48	\$10. after 3
Savon Printing	1,000 @ \$163.00	2,500 @ \$284.00	5,000 @ \$438.	10,000 @ \$897.00	no bid
Print Corp	1,000 @ \$103.	2,500 @ \$230.	5,000 @ \$410.	10,000 @ \$785.	no charge
Pine Barrens Printing	1,000 @ \$217.	2,500 @ \$354.	5,000 @ \$582.	10,000 @ \$1045.	\$10.00

<b>9B Blank Stock</b>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Quantity/Cost</u>	<u>Cost of a Proof</u>
Minuteman Press	1 Case @ \$366.85	2 Cases @ \$733.70	3 Cases @ \$1100.55	4 Cases @ \$1467.40	\$
Savon Printing	1 Case @ \$150.00	2 Cases @ \$300.00	3 Cases @ \$450.00	4 Cases @ \$600.00	\$
Print Corp	1 Case @ \$168.00	2 Cases @ \$336.00	3 Cases @ \$504.00	4 Cases @ \$672.00	\$
Pine Barrens Printing	1 Case @ \$140.43	2 Cases @ \$280.86	3 Cases @ \$721.29	4 Cases @ \$561.72	***pricing incorrect per Mike Cutrone from Pine Barrens, withdraws bid for this item.